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» Wayne Box Miller
BAND STORY

"

I have been a writer for over 30 years, 
specifically poetry and lyrics. Thanks to
 this group my songwriting has really 
increased. Dave Lenehan and I have 
written together, and I have a co-wrters
 credit with Bo Watson of Midnight Star 
(Work It Out). He has also written for 
Toni Braxton, The Whispers and others
 and we have written a song for Smokey
 Robinson recently that we hope gets 
placed.

I have always wanted to write songs 
even more than poetry after hearing 
Jerry Butler's "Never Gonna' Give You 
Up". They lyrics blew me away! Since 
then the influences listed on my page 
and others have intrigued me but none 
more than country music songwriters. I 
don't think anyone tells stories, creates 
titles like you do. 

Merging those styles with R&B 
influences, I hope to create a style that 
attracts artists and appeals to their 
fans...and labels.

GOD blessed me to write and I hope to 
keep givng the gift to the world...
"

LATEST NEWS

 

STATS

VISITS PLAYS
12,460 86
STREAMS DOWNLOADS
86 0

FEATURED SONGS

1 Would You Say Yes R&B

» Visit Our profile on Songwriters Workshop.org 
For additional information please contact us
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